HIGH COURT OF MADHYA PRADESH : JABALPUR

Endt. No. _|3%# /Confdl. /2017 Dated 3" February, 2017
11-3-121/92

Copy of Letter No. A-11016/9/2016-CLS-ll,  dated
02.01.2017 of Deputy Secretary to the Government of India, Ministry of
Labour and Employment, New Dielhvi, along with, enclosures, regarding
vacancy to the post of Presiding Officer in CGIT-cum-Labour Court at

Jaipur is being uploaded for information of all eligible candidates.

QEGISTRAR GENERAL

Encl: As above.




No. A-11016/9/2016-CLS-II
Government of India
Ministry of Labour & Employment
KK koK Kok

Shram Shakti Bhawan, Rafi Marg,
New Delhi — 110001.

Dated 02.01.2017

To,

The Registrar General,
All High Courts.

Sub: Filling up the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial

Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, Jaipur.

Sir,

I am directed to say that the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial
Tribunal-cum-Labour Court (CGIT-cum-LC) at Jaipur is to be filled up shortly in accordance with
the provisions contained in Sections 7 & 7A of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (relevant
extract of the Act placed at Annexure-I). According to these provisions, the post can be held
by a judicial officer who is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court or who has rendered not less
than three years’ service as an Additional District Judge or a District Judge. A serving Judge can

tion basis for a fixed term. A retired Judge can be appointed

on re-employment basis. The terms and conditions of appointment of a Judge to the post of

Presiding Officer will be as per Annexure-II-[The Presiding Officers of the Labour Court,
Industrial Tribunal and National Tri

bunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions
of Service) Rules, 2015],

2. The scales of ‘pay attached to the post of Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC are as
follows: : _
(i) Distt. Judge (Entry Level) - Rs.51,550—1230-58,930—1380—63,070/-

_(ii) Distt. Judge (Selection Grade) - Rs.57,700-‘1230-58,930—1380-67,210—1540—70,290/—
(i) Distt. Judge (Super time Scale) - Rs.70,290-1540-76,450/-

3. It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers WG are willing to be appointed
as Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC, Jaipur and who fulfill the eligibility conditions may please
be furnished to this Ministry within a period of two months from the date of issue of this letter
i.e. by 01.03.2017 for selection of a suitable officer. A set of three (03) proformas (Annexure-
IIL IV & V) is to be induded with each application. A check-list (copy placed at Annexure-
ITI) regarding the documents/copies enclosed may be sent with each application. The Bio-
Data of each of the officers may be furnished in the proforma placed at Annexure-1V to be
filed by the concerned officer and to be attested by the concerned Registrar General. The
be forwarded along with an abstract of ACRs (if
€ years duly certified in the proforma placed at
ACR dossiers and. vigilance, clearance (if applicable).

" 7. Continued on Page 2

R

nomination of each of the officers may
applicable to the officer) of the last fiv
Annexure-V, along with verified copies of

= D P H
JepuTl e
+

e thS)

8t . -
.':lgll W2t o1 o

Jabalin oy (-



-

4. It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who fulfill the requirements, as
mentioned above and are willing to take up the assignment on terms and conditions mentioned

proformas (Annexure-III, 1V & V) enclosed with each application.

last date of sending of applications may strictly be adhered to. It is informed that only the
nominations with complete proformas (Annexure-III, IV and V) and verified copies
of ACR dossiers (if applicable) received on/before 01.03.2017 will be considered by

the Ministry. The matter may kindly be treated as urgent.

6. It is further requested that this Circular may be given wide publicity including the Notice
Board of the Court so that there is sufficiently large number of candidates applying for the post.

Yours faithfully,

)
(Raj kumma’%)—"
Deputy Secretary to the Government of India
~ Tel. No. 011-23753079
Copy to: '

1. Ministry of Law and Justice, Department of Legal Affairs, Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi
with the request that a panel of names of Judicial Officers (retired or serving) who are
willing to be appointed to the post of the Presiding Officer of the CGIT. -cum-LC, Jaipur
may kindly be forwarded to this Ministry. '

2. - All Deputy Chief Labour Commissioners (Central) with the request to take up the matter
with the Registrars of the High Courts concerned for wide publicity of the circular.

Encl: Annexure-1, TI, III, 1V & V.
Imai
(Raj Kumar)
Deputy Secretary to the Government of India




(9 1I-978 3(i)] HIT =1 TSTYS : STHIYROE 5
11. Leave Travel Concession.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the leave travel
concession for self and family shall be as admissible to the highest grade in the Central Government.

m-__-,.u____...ﬁ»,;a:«.‘—‘
x

(2y  For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the Leave Travel Concession

shall be regulated under the rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of Presiding Officers
appointed on re-employed basis.

12. Conveyance Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
the conveyance allowance in the form of a fixed amount to be decided by the Central Government from time to time.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal may have an option either to have a

staff car for official purposes or use of own vehicle with a grant of seventy five litres of petrol per
month.

13. Transfer Travelling Allowance.—(1) The transfer travelling allowance shall be as admissible to a
Government Servant of the highest grade from home town to headquarters for joining the National Industrial Tribunal or
Labour Court and from headquarters to home town at the end of the assignment.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the transfer travelling allowance
P g g

shall be as per Central Government rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of presiding
officers appointed on re-employed basis.

14.  Contributory Provident Fund Scheme.~—The presiding officers shall be entitled to join Contributory
Provident Fund Scheme as per rules during the period of re-employment.

15.  Other Conditions of Service.—Matters relating to the terms and conditions of service of the Chairperson
or other Members with respect to which no express provisions has been made in these rules, shall be referred by the

Labour Court, Industrial Tribunal or National Tribunal to the Central Government for its decision, and the decision of the
Central Government thereon shall be binding.

16.  Power to relax,—The Central Government have power to relax the provision of any of these rules in
respect of any class or categories of persons.

[No. Z-25025/05/2013-CLS-II]
DHEERAJ KUMAR, Jt. Secy.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Dethi-110054.

. | Manerxuure I




Amexc e =T

Sec. 7] The Industrial. Disputes Act, 1947 . 19

(2) A conciliation officer may be appointed for a specified area or for
specified industries in a specified area or for one or more specified industries and
either permanently or for a limited period.

5. Boards of Conciliation—(1) The appropriate Government may as
occasion arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Board of
Conciliation for promoling the settlement of an industrial dispute.

"(2) A Board shall consist of a chairman and two or four other members, as
the appropriate Government thinks fit. .

(3) The chairman shall be an independent person and the other members
shall be persons appointed in equal numbers to represent the parties to the
dispute and any person appointed to represent a party shall be appointed on the
recommendation of that party: ) ' s }

Provided that, if any party fails to make a recommendation as aforesaid
within the prescribed timie, the appropriate Government shall appoint such
persons as it thinks fit to represent that parly.

(4) A Board, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwithstanding the
absence of the chairman .or any of its members or any vacancy in its number:

Provided that 'if the appropriate Government notifies the Board that the
services of the chairman or of any other member have ceased to be available, the’
Board shall not act until a new chairman or member, as the case may be, has
been appointed. . '

6. Courts of Inquiry.—(1) Theappropriate Government may as occasion
arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Court of Inquiry for -
inquiring into any matter appearing to be connected with or relevant to an
industrial dispute. ) ’

(2) A Court may consist of one independent person or of such number of
independent persons as the ‘appropriate Government may think fit and where a
Court consists of two or more members, one of them shall be appointed as the
chairman. : : : : . .

(3) ‘A Courl,. having the prescribed quorum, .may act nofwithstanding
the absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its
number: T . o R

Provided that, if the appropriate Government: notifics the Court that the
services of the chairman have ceased to be available, the Court shall not act until

a new chairman has been appointed.

7. ‘Labour-Courts.=(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more Labour.Conrts for the.adjudicatioins™

of-industrial“disputes’ relatmg'*tonanymmatte&speciﬁed,_.i__r\., the Second Schedule, »
and »forwperformmgv-such-.athgg functio .25 may be agsigned-to-them-under-this#

Act~~ -

(2)- A*Labour Court shall-consist of.ong 4.}'2Q{§Q{L9!Lb’..E’.PQ..E‘EPQ’}QIQQ..by. the-
appropriate -Government.” T ' )

1. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4, for section 7 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 7 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 3 (w.c.f. 26-6-1951). : ) .




——
L
‘

ARV I

/

%

}:'\ti"\.‘(f

20 The Industiial Disputes Aqt, '19,47 (Sec. 7

i

(3) A.person shall not be qualmed fo)ﬂmmlmenl,_gahmg_p;_:sxdmg offlcer,,«

of.al LabouL Court unlt.:.b—"-;r

(b) ; hr.: hab far. a_pg;x__qgl of not } less thn t};; ycars _bge .a‘ 1slr1<_:t!3_d_ge,

oran . ddmorul sttuct ]udge or, .

2[»&]]_ o - . .

2l .he has held any ]udlcml ofhv : in In i ot le l'han seven years,‘
~or

[(t;) he has been. the presiding oﬂxcer of a Lubour Courl constxtulg:d,,
- u.nder any Provmmal ‘Act’ or State“Act’for-not less than ‘five ‘years.]
“{(f) he is or hag.heen a Deputy Chicf.Labour Commissioner. {Cenlral) or
Iomt Cmmmssxoner of the Stale- Labour Department having a
degree «in.- !aw:and at least seven. yeaxs experlence in the labour
rlence* a8 Cancmalmn

Provxdui lhal no such Deputy Chlef Labou.r Comnussmner or
Joint- Labour Commissioner.shall be*appointed -unless+he; resigns/
from-the ‘service-of-the.Central Government.or State Government, as
‘the case may be, bgfore being appomled as (he prcsxdmg ofﬁcer or]
g) helis  an_officer of Indian Legal Se:
- experience in the gxadc]"“"’"‘““‘ S
STATE AMENDMLN'] S
Andaman and Nicobar Islands.-—In section 7 in sub-section (3), in clause (a) [now re-
lettered as clause (d)], for the words “seven years”, subsutute the wnrds Lhree years”.
[Vide Regulation 6 of 1964, sec. 2 (w.e.{.29-4-1964).] -
Goa—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (d) msc:t the fuuowmg clauses,
namely:

(dl) he has practised as an advocale or attorney for not less than seven years in a
i C!omt or in lwo or more such Courty in succession, or any Court
subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Cowt or Tribunal or Labour Courl
constituted under any law for the time being in force; or
(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office nol lower in rank
than that of Deputy Registrar of any Industrail Court or Tribunal or Labour
Court constituled under any law for the time being in force for not less than five -
gars; Or -
(d3) he holds a decree in Jaw of a u.mverslry established by law in a.ny part of India
i or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Commissioner OF Labour under a State Gnvemment or a
Union tersitory administration for nol less than flve years; or
[Vide Goa Act’5 of 1987, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 21-10- 1987)] )
Gujarat.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),—
i) in clause (b), after the words “Additional lelflt.( ]ud&g ', melt Lhe words “or a
Joint Judge or an Assislant ]ud 1e”; :
(u; in clause éd) for the words “seven years" substitule the words “five years”;.
(iii) in clause {e), for the words “five years” subslitute the worda “three years” and at
the end of the clause, insert the word “or”;". . .
(iv) after clause (e), insert the following clause, namelyi— ’ :
“(F) he has practised as an advocate or altorney for nol less than seven years in .a
High Court or any Court subordinate’ thereto or in any Industiial’ Court or
“In fustual ‘Tribunal or Labour Court cpnsbtuted undet any law for Lhe hme bemb :
in force.

1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, scc. 3 (w.e.f. 15- l2~1964) )
2. Clause (c) omilted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.ef. 21-8- 1984)
" 3. Clauses (a) and (b) reletlered as clauses (d) and (e) xeapecuvely by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f.
15-12-1964).
4. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, scc. 4 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

i

'
"
t
t
i
!

!
K
I
!
,: .
i

Sec. 7} . The Industrial Disputes. Act, 1947 21

[Vide Gu;urat Act 28 of 1977, scc. 2] .
Haryana.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),—
% for clause (b), substitute the following clause, name]y C
“(b) he is qualeu_d for a pomh-nenl as, is’ or lms been, a Dlst'ru:l ]udbe or an
Addilional District Judge or;'and”
(ii) after ¢lause (c), insert the following clause, namely:—
~"(cc) he has been 4 Commussioner of a .division or-an Adminisirdtive’ Secrefary to
. Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the ra_nk of a Joint
Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”,
" (Vide Haryana -Act 39 0f 1976, sec.’2 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).1
- Madhya Pradesh.—In 5e<mon 7, aﬁer sub-secuon (1), insert the following- sub- st_chon

. namely:—

“(1A) In addition lu Ihe f'uncllons specnfxed in sub- -section (1), the Labour Court shall
try offences punishable under this'Act and the Acts specified in Parl B of the
Secand Schedule.”
|Vide Madhya Pradesh Aci 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-1-1982).]
In section 7, sub-section (1A), as inserted by Madhya Pradesh Act 43 0f1981, sec. 3 (quoted

. above), has bu.n omitted. .

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Lahou: Laws (Amendment] and Miscellaneous Provisions Act,

) 2003 (28 of 2003].]

Maharashtra,—In sechon 7 m sub sechon (3) aIler clquse (d), insert !he tolluwu’\z, clauses,
namel —
. Y S(d1) hL has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in the

Court, or any court subordinate therefo, or any Industrial Court'or Tribunal
“or %..abour Court, constitutéd under any law for the time bein /in force; or
(d2) he holds a degree in'law of a university established by law in nny part of India
- and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than of Deputy Re;;xstrar
of any such Industrial Courl or Tribunal for not less than l}y‘q ;years; or

{Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, scc. 2.]

Aller clause (d2); insert the following clause, namely:—

“(d3) he'holds a'degree in law of a wuw_rm:y esfablished by law invany part of India
.and is holding or’ has held an. office not lower than that of Assistant
Cormmssxoner of Labour under the State Covemment for not less than five

** years; or!

(Vide Mal?amshtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 2 {(w.e.f. 27-5-1976).]

Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh. —In section 7, in sub-section (3), after Llause (b), insert the
followm clﬂuses, namely:— .

“(c} he is'or hag been a District Judge; or

(d) he has held the office of the Chairman or any other member of the Labour Appella te
Tribunal constituted under the Industrial Dispytes (Appellate Tribunal) Act, 1950,
or of any Tribunal for a'period not less than two years.

[Vide Pun{).nb Alct 8 0f 1957, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 3-6- 1957); Punjab Act 31 of 1966 (w.e.f. 1-11-1966). ]

Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982,-sec, 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1084).

T.]Jtln.r I’md«.sh.—[n section 7, after sub-section (3), insert ll\e foUowmg sub-section,
namely:—

“(3A) In relation tG mdu.,lnal dxspute other than that referred to in sub clnube (1) of
:clause . (a) of section 2. or in section 4 °of the Industrial Disputes (Banking and
Insurance Companies) Act, 1949, the provmon.s of sub-section (3) shull have
effect as if—

(n) after clause (¢) the fol]owmg new clause-; (d) and (e) had been added:—
“(d); is-or has been a Magistrate of the first class for a period exceeding’ two
ears;,
(e) 1ys adfersun possessing more than  two years practical experience of
- adjudicating or settling industrial d.\spptes '
(b) in the proviso after the WO!‘CL':. clau:e ®)” the woxd:, ur clause (d) or clause
e)*’had been added?. -

[Vide Uttar Pradesh Act 25 of 1951, séc. 2 (w.r. ef. 26- 6-1951)] ’

Ed.—The above said amendments were made prior lo the amendmenls made. by the
Central Acl 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964) and Act’ 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

West Bengal. ZIn’ section 7, in sub—secnan (3), for c]ause (b) sub:.u;ute Lhe following
clause namely:—

“(b) he’is, or has been, a District ]ud e or an’ Addmnnal Du.mcl ]udge, or

- [Vide West Beng,al Act 35 of 1989,. sec. § (w.e.f. 22-1-1989).) :




}Qﬂ e X e =Y

_ Sec. 7A] The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 23
The Industrial. Disputes Acl, 1947 [Sec. 7 B . . . ) ) )
- . Gea—In séction 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitute the following clauses,

COMMENTS - T namely.—-: .. . . . . -

Right of Labour Court : o ‘
The Labour Court/Tribunal has an inherent right in the interest of justice to seek

proper assistance and grant ‘leave’ to g party before -it ig regresented by a legal

practitioner; T.K. Varghese'v, Nichimen Corporation, {2002) IV LL}J ( upp) Bom 1018.

© 7 "(b) he.is, or has been, a D_istn'_ct}udge; or
) (c) he has, for a period of not less than Lhree years, been an Additional District Iud_ge
or an Assistant Jgdge; or . Do

L oom LS. £ ) e isiqualified fop asmotatment dge of the High Court”, ..
Oificarmale—(1) The. appropriate Govemment may, by nofification inz, (i e lied o appoinnen o o Judge of the High Courr'. -
the--Officlal“Gazette;* constitute “one*"or**more=Industrial..Tribunals =for--the- 4 e e to : L ’ zD 7A > '{lb :e,:cnon @)— "
adjudication-of-industrial_dis ltes relating tg an _matter, whether specified ‘in £ bwanak—la sec 101 /A, in sub-secti T . : . .
mé-—-Smond~-SchedMe4L..th Prturdxg"d‘“&%ﬁ"ng Yd for perfgrmiﬁg “such._pther. . ’ (i) in.clause (aa), after the words “an 'Addj tional District Juggg", insert the words or

“functions-as-may- be-assigned-to them viider this-A'ct]: 2 Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge”;

appropriate-Government - 21-8-1984)], insert the word “or’ at the end; .
3 A. person.shall not.he_qualified for appointment as the presiding officer T  (iif) after clause (b), insert. the following: clause, namely: R .
of. a-Tribunal-unlegs— : TR T - T TS Bl - “(c) he has for not less than five years been the presiding officer of a Labour Court
’ (2).-he-is;or-has been,.a Judge-of-a-High Courty-or®~ A : constituted under any law for the time being in force”,
Al S L ) Ol L - O ~ Pl . - ;. : ) ) . v
3(aa) .bhehas, fora period of not less than WQ@:YQE!Q_Q?EEQa [ [T s [Viidde (?Lpnral /"\ct 28 of.]???, sec. 3] ... S e o l
: or.an',.Additicinal--District.Judge;ﬁ[?ﬁi]]lh‘ G Ty T oln sechpn 7.5, in sub-section (3), after clause (c), insert, the following clause, namely:—
S[(b) _he is or m&he&erPM‘ Chief“Labo “(d) he holds a degree in law'of a University established by law in any part of India and
- t Commissioner. of tate. L

: (2);A-«-Tribunai*'sha—ll'“consist~*of*ene*-:pemomon1ly'mto-;be.~ap4pointed;ﬁy_4the'-' ) inclause (b) [Ed. clause (b) has beeq omitied by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (we.f. -

Commissioner (Central) or
ur_Department,. having .a.
ven years' experience in the labour

Comunissioner of Labour undei'_the State Government for not less than ten years”.

e e gt T . .y ST [Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1981, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 1-8-1981)]] " - S o
~three+years™of-experierice=as~Conciliation 0 [ J . 5
o My o ; P C ¢ HE : Ed. The above said amendmmts were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Provided..that_no. such_Deputy, Chief Labour, Commissioner.or L Pt 108, sec. d '6‘7[}\21-&19:4)' on () “
Joint Labour. Comm issioner-shall-be-appointed unless. he resigns ¢ oo . Haryana—In section 74, in sub-section (3)— )
from ihE.Sﬁ[yj;;g__Q the Central Govenmigg_g or §ggj&_Gmlement; -as - (i) for clause (aa), subsbmte_t'he following clause, f\ame!y;-- .
e case may be, re be g ap] téd as the presiding officer; or] A “(aa} he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an

_Additional District Judge; or”; and
" (i) after'claus'e::(azi),"ii.i}sért the follriwih'g clause, namely:—
. “(aaa) he has been a_Cpm_m.issiox}er of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of 2
" Joint Labour melpxissipnegwfgg a period of not less than two years; or”.
[Vide Haryana Act 39 of 1976, sec. 3 (w.e.f 12-8-1976)] N
Kerala.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (a), Substitute the f;)llpwhig_ciause,
namely:— R RPN e . . o
1 “(a) he is, or has been, a judicial officer not below. the rank of a District Judge,.or is
[ qualified for appointment as a Judge of 3. High Court; or”, .

experience -in-the-gradel]” - B
(4] The-appropriate-Governmen Lmay, if it so thinks fit, appoint two persns. .
,__a§,assessox?s;¢o.advise¢the«1ribunal;i£‘;t~1}§4£f & )Y

STATE AMENDMENTS o
Assam.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a) insert the following clause,
“(aa) he has worked as a District Judge ar as an Additional District Judge or as both for
- a total period.of not less than three years or is qualified for appointment as a Judge
of a High Court: . : o
Provided. that the appointment to a Tribunal of an'}vME i

l{c) he is‘an officer. of Indi :;Legaiiservice»-inwerad-;;_»m-with-—ﬁhree»y-eafs'

3
H

Vi ‘clause shall not be made -without consultation with f ssd ,f . [Vide Kerala Act 28—'0?1951, sec. 2‘(w:e.f;'27_~7r1961)]“ . e
Vile Assam-Act 8 of 1962, sec, 2 (w.ef, 30-4-1962).] . s : i Madhya Pradesh.—In section 7A, for sub-secti . o o
mmeB!}x,har—ln ‘sv'e(.'.tion‘ ?A, m sub-agcﬁon (3), gf@ glggsg (‘f_) msler 9{1""‘”‘{“5 clause, : name!y ‘:‘__ ya Pradesh, .  for sul Tv,:ej:u‘r.:n (3;):;1 suvb‘s’hh-.lte fhe ffﬂnfvlég .‘subv section,
* “(aa) he'has worked as a District Judge or as-an Additional District J@;dge or as both for ; “(3) A person shall not be qualified. for appointment as the Presiding Officer of a
. @ total periad of not less than tg;ee' years: R ’ L Tribunal unless— CL ' ) i
* ' Provided that the appointment to a Tribunal of any person qualified under this i he i has been, of a High Coiirt: ar
-clause shall be made in"consultation with the High' Court of th;l, State in which the { & . IR (la)) . ]m-_!s.';;ir ;Z forl;a, a ]_udge;o'f a ngh Court; or . .
Tribunal has of is intended to have, its usual- lace of sitting; or”,""" . . _(b) heis eligi b8 appointed a Judge of a High Court; or

v " 7" (®) ‘he has worked as President of the Board of Revenue; or IR

- : : (d) he has-worked as a'member of the Board of Revenue for a period-of not less

: - than three years; or v . . A : SREE

* (e} he has worked as Comumissioner of Labour for a period of not less than three
years; or . Lo .

[Vide Bihar Act 20 of 1959, sec. 2 (wef. 7:7:1959).] © -

‘1) 1,.!15: by' Act36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w:e‘_f. 10-3-1957). " - ¢ R . L
.2, Ins. by Act 46 of 1982, sec, 4(a) (w.ef. 218:1984), . o
3. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 4 (w.ef. 15-12-1964), o ’ i
4. The word “or” omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.ef. 21_—8—1_984_). .
, Ins, by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f, 15-9-2010): Earlier clause (b) wag omitted by Act46 of 1982,
sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984). )
6. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.ef. 159-2010).

is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than ‘that of Assistant .



D e

APRNE SUS

- Judge of a High Court”.

The Indusrrial.Disputes'~Act,- 1947 [Sec. 7A
‘() he has worked as a membcx 0[ the Industrial Court constituted under
section 9 of the Macthya Pradesh Induslrml Relations Act, 1960 (27 of 19b0),
.. for a period of not less than five. years.? e e
. [Vide Madhya Pladesh Act 19 of, .1988‘ 3 (w ef. 15 1 1939)] :
Mnlmmshtra - In section A, in sub-bectxon (3], in chuse (a) after the words * J“dbe of a’
High Court”, insert the words “or a DlslllCt ]udge ora pumon quahﬁed f01 appomtmcnl as a

- [Vide Maharashtra Act 2 of 1963 sec. 2 (w e.

In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in C]ause (aa), for’ 1hc words - ‘an Addlllonal Dlslncl
Judge”, subslituté ‘the words “an Additional District ]udbe or an Assmtant Judge or"

After clause (b),.[Ed. Clause (b) has been omltled by Central Act 46 of 1982 sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21:8°1984)], insert the following clause, n-lmely— EE

“(c) he has for not less than five years br.en 2 presxdmg ofﬂcet of a szbour Court,

constituted under any law for the time being in force.”

- [Vide- ahanahlrn Act 56 of 1974 sec: 3.] . . :
After clause (L) insert the following clause, namely:— : .
“(d) he holds debree in Jaw of a Umvexsnly established by law in any vat of India
and ".is holding - or: has held an’ office ‘not Jower in .rank’ than that of
A:.sxst'\m Commxssmmr of Labour undex lhe Shte Covqnment for not es tl_\an ten

.. years ! B

[an:.' Mﬂhﬂfdhhh‘a Act 22 of 1976 sec: 3] L . S
Mysore (Karnataka). —(1) In section 7A in e,ub-becuon (3), afler clause (a), insert ll\e
following clause, namely:—

“(aa)- he is, or has bu_n, a Du,mcl ]udgc, or”
[Vide Mysore Act 6 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f! 31-1 _1963)]
(2) In clause (aa) as inserted by Mysme Act 6 ol 1963, a[ler Lhe words ”stmv_t Juclbe
insert the ‘wards “for a period of not less than three years.”
[Vld:. Mysoxe Act 257af 1963, sec. 2 (w ef. 12—12 1963)]

Ed. The above said amendments were made prlor to the amend ments made hy Centml Acl -

46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).”
Orissa. —I.n sechon 7A in sub secuon 3), afler clause (a), insert Lhe fuBowmb clause,
namely:—" -~ "7 E
“(aa) he has been a mLmber of the qusa guperlor ]Luijcnl Servlce for a permd of not
less than seven years.” .- .
[Vide Orissa Act 6 of 1960, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 17-3-1960).] -
West Bengal.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words "I—hgh

" Court”, insert the'words “or-a District Judge or an-Addilional Dislricl Judge”. .-+ o

[Vide West Bengal Act 17 of 1958, sec, 3 (w.e.f.-22-9-1958).] .

In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), bubstxlued the foUowmg clause, namdy —
- “(aa).he:is; or has been, a District Judge or an Ach;huona] Dlst_ucl Judbe or

[Vldl‘ West Bcnbal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 4.] :

COMMENTS 1 ' %
Power to constitute Iuduslrml Couxlf]'nbunal C o

Seclion 7A . empowers the - applopuate Govemment to:' 'hstituié ‘one or more
Industrial Tribunals for.adjudication of the dlsputes relalmg to ‘any matter specified in the

Schedules. The Second Schedule enumerates the matters wh:ch Iall within the jurisdiction -

of the Labour Coult ‘The Third Schedule enumerates the matlers ‘which fall within the
jurisdiction of the Industrial Tribunal; Jagdish Narain Shnrmo_v! I_\fn/n;»t_lmq Patrika Lid., 1994
LLR 265 (Raj).

1.he Cenual Goverr\ment

b Nalxonal Tubunal if—

. claise, nainely:—

1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w ef. 10-3- 1957)

_S_éc_.-?C}_ ' The Industrial, Disputes Act, 1947 ' : 25

1[7B ‘National Tribunals. ~=(1) The Central Government may, by notification

in L\e Official Gazette, constitute one or more National Industrial Tribunals for
the adjudication of industrial’ disputes- -which, in the opinion” of ‘the Central
:Government, involve questions’ of national importance ‘or ‘are of: such a nature

that industrial establishments situated in mbre than one State axe llkely to be
mLcresled in, or affecled by, stich dlsputes

L) A Nat10na1 ”lnbunal shall COl\Sth of one person only tQ be appomted by

(3) A'person shall niot. be quahhed for appomlment as. the presldmg folcer
of.a ‘National Tribunal 2(ur\less he is, or hag heen, a Iudge of a_High Court]."

(4) The' ‘Ceritral Govermnment may,.if it so thinks fit, appoint two persons as

'iassessms to’ adv1se ‘the N’monal Tnbunal in the- proceeding before it.]-

1[7C Dlsquahﬁcz\hons “for" the presxdmg officers ‘of’ Labour - Courts,

f__.‘Tubmmls and " National Tribunals.—No person shall be appomled to, ‘or

continue in, the office of the pxesxdmg offmer o[ a Labour ‘Court, Tnbunal or

(a) ]u_ is' not an ﬁxdeper\dent pelson or "
(b) hf: has attamed the.age of mxty-ﬁye yea1s]

o1 'STATE AMENDMENTS -
Assun —In section 7C,-in clause (h), insert the followmg proviso,’ namely-—

“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State

::Government ‘attains; the” age. of sixty-five years_before the: completion of any

proceedm&s pendmg befule him, the State Government may, if in.the opinion Qf

. -’such.Governmient public interést so requires, order his continuance in office for a

period not exceedmg six'months for completion of the procv.edmgs
[V/de Assam Act 3 of 1962, sec,’3 (w. ef 30-4- J96'2)J

“Punjab, Haryana, « 'or\ 7C for clauée (b) subshl‘ute the followmg

#(b); he has atlained thie 2 1ge 9 su(ty-seven years - A et
- [Vide Pun]ab Act 'Bof- 1957, sec: 3 (wi.e.f. 3-6-1957); and the: CLntral Act 31 of 1966] e
* West Bengal-—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the folluwmg proviso, namely— :
“Provided that where such pres:dmg officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Government attains the age of s;xty—fwe years before complehon of any proceedings
pending before -himi)’ the Stale ‘Government may,” if in"'the opinion of such
Govenunent pubhc Interest 5o requires, order his continuance in office for a period
.- not exceeding six months “for, complehon of the pxoceedmgs “

[V:dc West Bengnl Act 11 of 1959, s (w ef, 27- 10-1959).] -

BE SECTION 7D . R
Gujarat——After section 7C, insert-the following secnon namely-— S

y 517Dt g:.rmm Dlstnc! }urigas qualified for appointnents. op Tnbmm] constituted

y State ovcmment—Notwnthslandm nything cont -
.semon 7A—— " g anything con amed m suh secbon (1) of
. (1) The Stala Govemment ‘may conshtute an Industrial Tnbunal under thar sub-
. section for performmg such other functions as may be assigned to it under this Act.
(2) Where the State Govemment constitutes a Tnbunal under ‘section 7A, the
. Tribunal may. c consmt of a personwho i IS, or has been, for, a penod of not less than

2. 'Subs. by Act-46 of 1982, se. 5, for’ certain words (w a.f. l21-8 1984)




AVU‘\.Q_)(‘ Wy ¢ -*I

The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7C

e 26

5 years, a District Judge or an Additional | or Joint District Judge. and
notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (3) of section 7A but subject to
section 7C, such person shall be deemed to be qualified for appaintment as the
presiding officer of the Tribunal. . T
(3) The appointment of a person qua
’ " consultation with the High Court.”
- [Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 9-8-1962).} :

[8. Filling of -vacancies.—If, for ‘any reason a vacancy (other -than a
temporary absence) occurs in the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court,
Tribunal or'National Tribunal or in the office of the Chairman or any other
member of a Board or Court, then, in the case of a National Tribunal, the Central
Government and in any other case, the appropriate Government, shall appoint
another person in accordance with the provisions of this Act to fill the vacancy,
and the proceeding may be continued before the Labour Court, Tribunal,
National Tribunal, Board or Court, as the case may be, from the stage at which
the vacancy is filled.] R : ’ BN o

2{9. Finality of orders constituting Boards, etc.—(1) No order of the
appropriate Government or of the Central Government appointing any person as
the Chairman or any other member of a Board or Court or as the presiding
officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or National Tribuna! shall be called in
question in any manner; and no act or proceeding before any Board or Court
shall be called in question in any manner on the ground merely of the existence
of any vacangy in, or defect.in the constitution gf, such. Board or Court.

(2) No settlement arrived at in the course of a conciliation proceeding shall
be invalid by reason only of the fact that such settlement was arrived at after the
expiry of the period referred to in sub-section.(6) of section 12 or sub-section (5)
of section 13, as the case may be. IR . :

(3) Where the report of any settlement arrived at in the course of conciliation
proceeding before'a Board is'signed by the Chairman‘and all the other members
of the Board, no such settlement shall be invalid by reason only of the casual or
unforeseen absence of any of the members (including the Chairman) of the'Board
during any stage of the proceeding.] o A T =

S[CHAPTER -lIA
S . NOTICE OF CHANGE ) o
* 9A. Notice of change.~—No, employer, who proposes to effect any.change in
the conditions of service applicable to any workman in ‘respect of any matter
specified in the Fourth Schedule, shall effect such change,~; . "+ - .
(a) without giving to the workmen likefy to be affected by such change
a notice in the prescribed manner of the nature of the. -change
-~ proposed "to be effected; or T
(b) within twenty-one days of giving such riotice:’
. Provided that. no notice shall be required. for effecting any such change—

lified under clause (2) shall be ‘made after

1. Subs. Ly Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 8 (w.e.f. 10—3;1957). Earlier section 8 was substituted
) by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 26-6-1951), « “ - i PR .
2. Subs. by'Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 9 (w.e.£, 10-3-1957). Earlier section 9 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 26-5-1951), . '

3. Chapter A (containing sections 9A and 9B) ins, by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 6 (w.e. 10-3-1957).” |

ST e L

¥ fhg e




Annexure—1L

W o Eho TH0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India
STHTHRUT -
EXTRAORDINARY ‘
W [[—@US 3 SU-@Us (i)
PART II—Section 3 Sub-section (i)

YT R ¥ Werilv
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

| 275] g Tewelt, sewfyam, et 30, 2015/dvm@ 10, 1937
No. 275] NEW DELHI, THRUSDAY, APRIL 30, 2015/VAISAKHA 10, 1937

FH 3 ASAIR HATAT
g

T2 faw=l, 6 319, 2015

LR, 336(x1).— =T awhR, enfE R afafiay, 1947 €Y g 38 6t 9g-arg (1) %
@E(W)WWQMWWW@Q%W%HWW% ol —

1.l a R e —(1) 37 Pt # |fen A s, AN e st ok ity srfgecor
(I, 9 S 77 Far F e o o) fes, 2015 8

(2) T TS F I THTE & AT F 799 24 |
2. AT —(1) 57 fawt & ot o % weed & serar sfdm 7 8y —
() “erferfRam & sienfis fare afafay, 1947 (1047 7 14) safdm &

(@) “lotefie st & srfdfiem Y e 7, 4Ry 73 A1 Ay 7@ F el Rorehw aftwrd F ww
¥ fegen = fRe sl

(2) ST =T AT 9= %, ST &7 Frawt § wge § aur oRefia wdY § g ey § afenfa @
S gl ot § S I erfafamy § wern o

3. wwE T farea mrrefter £ foria s ¥ = # wRfaRs § <o §, g i @
Wmfﬁqaﬁﬁ'@“ﬁﬁ?ﬁmﬁ?ﬁmﬁﬁﬂﬁ@ﬂﬁﬁgﬁﬁma’lﬁ:ﬁw‘gﬁ%m@’ﬁI

1926 G1/2015 ¢}]




2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

4, Yaa.—(1) THT arfdERer F QoA afdwrd &1 3+ 80,000 %, (F¥a) wiawmg i e =2 & g
v Ry siata Jag Amda f gar § sty a i arfgw Aot £ zar § g9 d97
dr g ’

(2) = =aTgTerg a7 e stftraer ¥ ferdie sfgETd F aaw Fe g i—

(i) fForert Famefter (w2 w) - 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070 =.

(ii) e maraela (39w oft) - 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210 %.

(iii) TSretT =amaefter (erfeser aaw) - 70,290-1540-76,450 .

w3 7TE ¥ S & wwet Y9, Y97 GHGed 47 309 GG F F1ae 1§, AR AR Al

7ig T & Nere afdw & =7 § & =it & Rgfe $ qar 8, S =rids 47 a1 90 967 54
A (FE1T) AT T T F GG A F g F JariAgs ¢ e Rrew Serw F O g R demRgh
¥ FTAY T ATH AT AT AT HL @I AT ITH FH % oI ek gy A g, Trewe arfgw F g uw
o Ia7 ¥ g YT & TUa it G F9 FCRGT ST
5. Ww.—wmﬁmmﬁ@ﬁwwaﬁmﬁﬁmw%
Faq ArEelea F T |

(2) =¥ =TT AT AR atgEer F Feri afRwiEr #1 9g auged Hgs w90 I FA &

TFER TR AT FE AR % qg F AfREgl g qeg-awg o anghka e S wr g

qAfASA i gl % e srgla sywfoudl ¥ Tgd Yom ¥ w9 o Ry W ¥ o F Aegefi

Auil
6. F{?RSF%{G‘?W——U Tléﬁs{laquawlémm ARIFIRET FY a8 WX TR W4T ¥ G S 9v
T & ST w A g |

(2) = FarTErT AT A afdma, F ferdi sRmREt ¥ A TR W S awE B
qug F fewiat S5 gar e Rt F s BRafT g
7. R Ramme i st F Tordi= sf@mRal & forg Sl aR ey dieHT F g
SF QAT F T G JUSTo T ST TG Herl T T JIoAT qHTeT § AGl ¢, 98 W F Feed a4
(e afaal) fem, 1944 § 2 SuafeE gieegiy o % g gaer giv |
(2) =9 =TaTerE AT A At F ferdia afdwial F v, & gt 5= a@r
& g F ataswid! i gar aug el F e et g _
8. ga.—gy afdew ¥ forfle afgwiat § g gf & @&4fi aew 9 =l ¥ d9Ra
ATAENST T AT TT BT |
(2) = waraterd 41 denfe afgsor ¥ derdla afdwifEt F forg, gt & 9dfim wme
TR & q4g F Afdwrigt #1797 9] Fert & aefiw BiRatig g
9. & AT wRr—(1) e sl % foreiT ittt % forg ST s galsa ag-giar
7 RS ger A+ T e wiaera FT X wewT SR ST w1 yee AT S |
(2) =W AT T SRE fdeer F fora sfgfal F Mg Fe a0 & g F
FHATICGT 3 Tor 79T IR Aokt FRrar i & wae T ST |




N

AV\ ne Xuee ~I

(o I-@v8 3(i) ] WA 1 TSI : STHIYRO] 3

10. ww.—%w%ﬁﬁﬁmm%wwmﬁwwm%mw
AT % FHRTC G |

11. gﬁwmﬁ.—(nvﬁwm%ﬂaﬁwmﬁﬁ%ﬁqéﬁ%w%m%ﬁ%w
TAT AT T SR g ¥ g gt amar Ramna 8ni )

(2) =5 AT S AN fF arferor ¥ froris sftefat ¥ fr gt amm Rema ferde afemiRa
ﬁwﬁﬁm%wwwﬁgﬁﬁ%wg?%ﬁﬂwﬁﬁﬁwmmﬁﬁ%mﬁw%ﬁuﬁﬁﬁm
12. A& WL—(1) TEH afewor ¥ orfin afwiat F fre S awr g a9 a9 1 R

HTTE Fad T F =7 & a1g ST F5 ware Ry s |

(2) = =mery At sienfas stftreor % forta iR & ag freer @ B ar ¥ ared
w%m%ﬁqu@mmﬁmﬁmwmwﬁmwwﬁa%ﬁ

T FY |
13. WWW.—U)WWW%WW%WWFWWW@W

w@wwmwmwmm%ﬁqwﬁgwwsﬁtw@m%wgﬁw
HEATHT o g TR T HT ST 7T FT ST |

(2) =W =g ar denfE afgwor § forfta afewmiet ¥ Rro e o T
@ﬁﬁm%wwwﬁqﬁﬁ%waﬂﬁﬁﬁmwﬁs%%ﬁ#ﬁww%amwﬁﬁ%
STHTC AT |

14. WW—%%.—WW%WW—%W%W%W
QAT T srafer & SR [ 1 gF 2T

15. Wﬂmwﬂ’.—mnmﬁfﬁm%ﬂ%aﬁﬁ‘aﬁ%sﬁmﬁ?maﬂﬁmw%wxamm
Wﬁ%%ﬁaﬁﬁsﬁﬁﬁ%%ﬁﬁww%ﬁﬁw%mww, Nt
mew@wmmﬁﬁ%%qwﬁaﬁrﬁwmmwwﬁﬁmmwrﬁm:

16 faflrer 2 i e —mfter w1 57 Rt % Pl sway 1 frfl o avvad & saRedt 6 smaa
frferer s i orfRe St |

[€. S1=-25025/05/2013-gera-2]
A g =
MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 6th April, 2015

G.S.R. 336(E).—In excercise of the powers conferred by clause (c) of sub-section(1) of Section 38 of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Presiding Officers of the Labour

Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service)
Rules, 2015.

(2)  They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Definitions.—(1) In these rules, unless the context otherwise requires,-

(@) **Act” means the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 1947);




A@'(&'\G_X I rj_t

\

4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(b) “Presiding Officer” means a person appointed as presiding officer under Sections 7, 7A or Section 7B
of the Act.

(2) All other words and expressions used and not defined in these rules but defined in the Act shall have
meanings respectively assigned to them in the Act.

3. Duration.—In case of appointment on deputation of serving judges as presiding officer, the normal period
of appointment shall be for a period of three years and in case of retired judges, the appointment shall be till the age of
65 years.

4, Salary.—(1) The Pay of the Presiding Officer of National Tribunal shall be fixed @ Rs 80,000/- (fixed)
per month and this shall include the deputation allowance in case of serving judges and gross pension in case of retired
judges.

(2) The Salary of the Presiding Officer of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be-
(i) the District Judge (Entry Level)  ~ Rs. 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070
(i) the District Judge (Selection Grade) — Rs. 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210
(iii) the District Judge (Super time Scale) — Rs. 70,290-1540-76,450

per month inclusive of gross pension, pension equivalent or other retirement benefits, if any:

Provided that in the case of an appointment of a person as a presiding officer, who has retired from Judicial
Service or as Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or Joint Commissioner of the State Government and who

is in receipt of or has received or has become entitled to receive any retirement benefit by way of pension, the pay of

* presiding officer shall be reduced by the gross amount of Pension from the Pay so fixed.

5. Dearness Allowance.—(1) The presiding officers of National Tribunal shall receive the dearness allowance
at the rate as admissible to the serving judges of the High Court.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be entitled to dearness allowance as
applicable to Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government drawing an equivalent pay from time to time
subject to the condition that relief of pension is deducted from the emolument drawn during the period of
re-employment.

6 ' City Compensatory Allowance.—(1) For presiding officers of National Tribunals, the city compensatory
allowance shall be as admissible to the serving judges of High Courts. o C

(2) For presiding officers of Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the cily compensatory allowance shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group —A” Officers of the Central Government.

7. Medical Concession.—(1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the Central Government Health
Scheme facilities shall be available at the station of posting and where the Central Government Health Scheme is not in
operation, they shall be entittled to the facilitie’ as provided in the Central Services (Medical Attendance) Rules, 1944. -

(2) For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the medical facilities shall be regulated
under the rules as applicable to the Group-* A” Officers of the Central Government.

8. Leave.—(l) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be as
admissible to the serving judges of the High Courts.

(2) For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government.

9. House Rent Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
rent free furnished accommodation or, as the case may be, the house rent allowance at the rate of thirty per cent of the
basic pay.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, there shall be provided the House
Rent Allowance as admissible to the Group-“*A” Officers of the Central Government.

10. Travelling Allowances.—The presiding officers shall be entitled the travelling allowance as per their
entitlement on the rates at the time of their re-employment.




| . _ , Annexure-III
gV

Check-list for each judicial officer to be considered for the post
of Presiding Officer, CGIT-cum-Labour Court, Jaipur

Name of the Officer:

Sl. Document Status of enclosure
No. of document

Y -Yes

N -No

NA — Not Applicable

1 Copies of Annual Confidential Reports of the officer
during the last five years

2 Vigilance clearance of the officer

3 Integrity certificate of the officer

l 4 Annexure-IV
(Proforma for Bio-Data of the Officer)

I 5 Annexure-V
(Proforma for ACR Gradings for the last five years of the
Officer)

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General
of the concerned High Court)




Annexure-IV

Proforma for Bio-data
(to be filled by the judicial officer concerned)

Name (in full)

Date of Birth

Educational Qualification

Particulars of Service in brief with dates of
each appointment held from the level of
Additional District Judge or equivalent post

(In Chronological Order)

(Note: Experience with regard to Labour
matters may be specifically mentioned)

Details Name of the last/current post
in Date of appointment to
respect | |ast/current post

| of1ast/ " pate of retirement
current
post Scale of pay
held Last pay drawn

Address for communication

Phone no. (Office)

(Residential)

(Mobile)

E-mail address

Date: . Signature:

Place: Name:




Annexure-V

Proforma for abstract of ACR Gradings for the ACRs of the last five years of each
judicial officer to be considered for the post of Presiding Officer,
Central Government Industrial Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, Jaipur

Name of the Officer:

Sl. | Year/Period | Details of Details of | Details of
No. Reporting Reviewing | Accepting
Authority & | Authority & | Authority &
Grading Grading Grading
1
2
3
4
)

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General)



	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005
	00000006
	00000007
	00000008
	00000009
	00000010
	00000011
	00000012
	00000013
	00000014
	00000015
	00000016

