HIGH COURT OF MADHYA PRADESH : JABALPUR

Endt. No. 1256 /confdl. /2016 Dated 14" December, 2016
11-3-121/92

Vacancy to the post of Presiding Officer at CGIT-cum-Labour
Court at Chandigarh-ll as informed by the Under Secretary to the
Government of India, Ministry of Labour and Employment, New Delhi is

being uploaded for information of all eligible candidates.

(MAR@%%&)R MAMTANI)

REGISTRAR GENERAL

Encl: As above.

r — e s b B TR b e e e e o e . - . e m e s -




20 The Industrial D..mb&m.m Act, ...EAN ' [Sec. 7
& v g (3) A_person shall not be qualified for appointment.as. the presiding officer ~

it e g

of.a_Labgur Court, unless=; . L : -
}((a) _heis, ‘or has been, a Judge of a High Court; ors.

(b) he-has, for.z pexiad of not less,tha B8, V2ATS, heen a District u._.,ﬁwmw%.

‘ or.an_Additional District Judge; T

2[+2]] R T e b i i S . ’ . . .

)] _he has held any judicial oftice i India for not less than seven yeays
oF ; T o

u:wzrwrmmvmn:.mﬁwnmm.aimommnmn om:v,‘rb_uosn.nonz.n@vmﬁcnnn\
SXind&r any Provincial ‘Act or State“Act for ‘not less*than five years.]
(5 he is or has.been a Deputy Chief Labour (Commissioner-(Central) or
Joint  Commissioner of the State Labour Department, having a
degree -in-law-and. at least seven 'years’ experience in the labour

department including three years’ of. exparience..as_Concilidtion

Officer: 47 = " T e T

Provided that no such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner or
Joint- Labour Gommissioner-shail- be*appointed-unless:he. resigns/

from-the“service-of the-Central Government or State Government, as

the case may be, before bemg appointed £s the presiding officer; or]
al Service in Grade III with three years’

< v i
R S 3 -
23

“(g) he is pn officer of Indian Legal Serv
experience in the grade™ 7 ™

Pt B, it i
R L SR

STATE AMENDMENTS
Andaman and Nicobar Islands.— In section 7, in sub-secton (3), in clause (a) {now re-
lettered as clause (d)), for the words “seven years”, substitute the words “three years”.
{Vide Regulation 6 of 1964, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 29-4-1964)] =" - . . - ’ . .
Goa.—In’ section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:— : o T
Y “(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in a
High Court or in two or more such Courts in succession, or any Court
. subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal or Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time beingin force; or = T T
(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not fower in rank
i ) than that of Deputy Registrar of an Industrai! Court or Tribunal or Labour
:, - Court tonstituted under any law for the ime being in force for not less than five °
, ears; or - - : . . .
i (d3) wﬁm holds a decree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
: or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Commissipner of Labour under a State Government or a
. Union territory administration for riot léss than five years; or”,
[Vide Goa Act’5 of 1987, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987).}" "' = ™ = 7
Gujarat.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),— = =" T oo o .
Na in clause (b), after the words “Additional District Judge”, insert ‘the words “or a

R P d

Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge”; " - c
m,-w in clause .Mn_v for the words “seven years” subslitute the words “five years”;
. (iii) in clause {e), for the words “five years” substitule the words “three years” and at
* _the end of the clause, insert the word “or”;". .

(iv) after clause (e), insert the following clause, namely:i— - :

“(f) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in a

! A A..,MW%T ourt or any Court subordinate thereto. or in any Industrial’ Court or
us

trial Tribunal or Labour Court noimﬁﬁnn E&E. any law for the time being

2. Clause (c) omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

3, Clauses (a) and (b) relettered as clauses (d) and (e) respectively by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.c.f.
15-12-1964). :

4. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 4 (w.e.f 15-9-2010).

|
B
s
w i in force.”
c "1, Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964).

‘
b
!

o Lon

cemaem g

Sec. 7} . The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 21

[Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 2.
Hary=na.— In section 7, in sub-section (3),~
m‘w for clause (b), substitute the following clause, namely:—
" ""(b) he is qualified for appointment as, is’or has been, a District Judge or an
’ Additional District ?m e or; and” . .
(ii) after clause (c), insert the following clause, namely:—
#(¢c) he has been s Commissioner of a division or an Adminisirative Secretary to
., Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of 2 _wn.._:.
Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.
{Vide muﬁwpﬂm Act 39 of 1976, sec. 2 {w.e.f. 12-8-1976).] -
Madhya Pradesh-—In section 7, after sub-section (1), insert the following-sub-section,
’ y “(1A) In addition to the functions specified in sub-section (1), the Labour Coyrt shall
try offences punishable under this Act and the Acts specified in Part B of the
Second Schedule.” ‘
[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-1-1982).]
In section 7, sub-section (1A), as inserted by Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (quoted

. above), has been omitted. -

{Vide Madhya Pradesh Labour Laws (Amendment) and Miscellaneous Provisions Act,
2003 (28 of 2003).] o .
. M»Prvnvmrg‘g section 7, iny sub-sectior: (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:— ! ' ’
<< -#(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in the
Iwmr Court, or any court subordinate theseto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal
or Lahour Court, constituted under any law for the time wmwzm.m: force; or
(d2) he halds a degree in law of a wniversity established by law in any part of India
- and is hoiding or has held an office not lower in rank than of Deputy ﬁmm.ma.m..
of any such ihadustrial Court or Tribunal for not less than fiyg.years; or”.
[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 2.] o
After clause (d2), insert the following clause, namely:.— o t
“(d3) he holds a degree in law of a universi established by law in any part of India
and is holding or’ has held an office not lower than that of Assistant
Commissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than five
- years; or”. o ' o
-~ [Vide zbwunpwwqm Act 22 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 27-5-1976).] .
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (b), insert the
following clauses, namely:— o
. :?M he is or has been a District Judge; or -~ : EE
(d) he has held the office of the Chairman or EWW other member of the Labour Appellate
isputes (Appellate Tribunal) Act, 1950,

Tribunal constituted under the Industrial
or of any Tribunal for a period not less than two years.” .
" [Vide Punjab Act 8 0f 1957, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); Punjab Act 31 of 1966 (w.e f.'1-11-1966).]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984). S S :
ﬂmnmu.. Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (3), insert the following sub-section,
namely:— - P
Y “(3A) In relation tg industrial dispute other than that referred to in sub-clause (i} of
*".clause.(a) of section 2.or in section 4 ‘of the Industrial Disputes (Banking and
Insurance Companies) Act, 1949, the provisions of sub-section (3) shall have
effect'as if— . . L A . N
(a) afler clause (¢) the following hew clauses (d) and (e) had been added;—
_"(dy is-or has been a Magistrate of the first class for a period exceeding two

v

.Anv.rm. wawumnwo: _vowwnmmm:mﬂo.wmziﬁgo. %m&nmmv;nznw_mxvﬁ._,m:nncm
. adjudicaling or settling industrial disputes”; e ,
(b) in the proviso after the words “clause (b)” the words “or clause (d) or clause
(e)” had been added”. - o N
[Vide Uttar Pradesh Act 25 of 1951, sec. 2 (w.r.e.f. 26-6-1951).] : :
Ed.—The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the
Central Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964) and Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
West Bengal—In section 7, in sub-section (3), for ‘tlause (b) substitute the following
clause, namely:— : . St v :
“(b) he’is, or has been, a District Judge or an Additonal District Judge; -or”.
[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 22-1-1989).] :




e e e e = e e

22 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

nOEZmZ.Hm
Rignt of Labour Court
The Labour Court/Tribunal has an Ermnm:" right in the interest o* justice to seek
propar assistance and grant ‘leave’ to a party before it is represented by a legal
_unmnzagmv T.K. Varghese v..Nichimen Corporation, (2002) IV LLj (Supp) Bom 1018.

17A =Tribunals:~—(1) The. vmvmﬁo_u:wam Govemment may, by notification inZ.i.

{he--Official “Gazette;“constityte * orie*'or** more-=Industrial--Tribunals ~for-the-
v&ﬁﬂﬁmg:..o?bncﬂﬂwrnﬁ ates relating to any matter, whether specified in
the -Second-Schedule-or_the_Third Schedule [and for~ erforming such, other
~functons-as-may be-assigned-to-them uirider’ “thisAlet] = -
(2 - A -Tribunal-shalil*consist- ngmcﬂmwmcntoEio\ aw«wwﬁosnmutv«bo
upprepriate-Government.
(3) A-person shall.not.be qualified for appointment as the
of. & Tribunal-unless— i
(a).-he is, or-has been,-a-Judge-of a High-Court;-or*» .
3(aa) .. he has, for a period of not less than three-years, been a mmﬁnrﬁﬁnmm
or.an Additional- U_mgnﬁcnmm Afsag]f. -
é&! he_is_or hag been a Reputy Chief Labour Commissioner Anmbwgc _or
Joint n:BBm@Bﬁ;P;.@,ﬁ;m?@choE Department,. having .a.
awmumm in law and at least seven years’ experience in the labour
department--including amﬁmm\%mmam%omf»xvnﬂagm. as~Conciliation
Officer:

Provided.--that no._ stch Gwﬁcq Chief Labour Commissioner .or

he, vﬂm&nﬁm;o?nmn

24 Lo A

Joint Labour Commissioner-shall-be:. appointed.unless he resigns
from the service of the Central Government or State Government, as'-

the case may. b e, before b, r@wwmvmsﬁma'mw; the | presiding officer; or]
‘[(c) he 'is"an_officer. of Indian Legal mmgnw. @nwﬁm.E.fEﬁﬁmm yeais’
experience-in-the-grade’] .

(4) The mvvnovasnm.ﬂoggma may, if it so thinks %F@vﬁoﬁk%bmmmobmu

S 2 2R T e 2

as. wumamomm..~9bn<a?gv§w_ in the ,mBnmmmEm..v»momwh Hi

I.lll'r.ll'l F}l.v..kl. —! DR
STATE Emzczmz.u. S
..wm:E_l.H: section 7A,. in sub-section (3), after clause ?v insert the ?:os.Er nFE.@
namel
“(aa) he has io..wnm as a District Judge or as an >&&wc:u_ District ?&mm or as g:_ for
. a total period of nat Jess than three years or is qualified for mwvosgmzn asa ?&m.w
of a High Court:
-Provided that.the appointment to a Tribunal of any person. Acurmwn E.&nn this
-clause’shall not be made ‘without consultation with >8n§ Iﬁr Court; or”,
- [Vide Assam' Act 8 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e:f. 30-4:1962).] .
Bihar.—In mwnwo: u? in mcv section va. w:ﬁ n:.:wm ?v _
namel e e
! :N.m-v he has Eonrnn_ asa Usgnn Judge or as-an >nEEEE_ UGD.»Q ?&mm or as both for
) a total period of not less than three years:
, " Provided that the »Euo_:gn:o to’a Tribunal of any _uanmcs Azm:mmu under this
i . .clause shall be made in consultation with the High' Court 6f Em State in which the
- Tribunal has or is intended t6 have, its usual 1_% of si
ﬁ ~<an.~..v—.>n~noon Smw vannﬁimmv.v Guw:

‘Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 ?snm 10-3-1957).
Ins. by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4(a) (w.e.f. 21:8-1984),
Inz, by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964).
The word “or” omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

, Ins, by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010). Earlier clause (b) was omitted by Act 46 of 1982,
_ sec. 4 (wee.f. 21-8-1984).

I 6. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

?:oiSw clause,

R

 Sec. 7 : The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 23

Dcu —In sgction 7A, in mc?mnnac: Auy for clause (aa), substilute the following clauses,
namely;— L .
“(b) he is, or F.E been, a 0552 ucamm or
(c) he has, for a penod of not less than three years, been an Additional District Judge
, or an Assistant Judge; or - s
(d) he is-qualified for appointment as a Judge of the High Court”.
:\in Goa Act 5 of 1987, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987) ]
Qéa-pn ~—In section 7A, in mcv\mnhcon_ (3),—
T i clause (aa), after the words “an Additional District .—:nwm insert the words “or
a Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge”;
(i) in clause (b) [Ed. n_.:.mm :.: has beeq omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)], insert the word “or” at the end;
(iii) after clause (b), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(c) he has for not less than five years been the presiding officer of a Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force”.
- [Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 3.]
In section 7A, in sub-sgction (3), after clause {c), insert, the following clause, namely:—
“(d) he holds a degree in law’of a University established by law in any part of India and
is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than that of >uw_m8=n
Commussioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than ten u\mm_.m
[Vide Gujacat Act 22 of 1981, sec. 5 (w. e f. 1-8-1981).]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.l. 21-8-1984).
Haryana.- In sechion 7A, in sub-section {3),—
(i) for clause (aa), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(aa) he is qualfied for mvvosgmsﬁ as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
Additional District Judge; or”; and
' (ii) after clause (aa), insert the mo:os:sm clause, :mamq!
. “(aaa)_ he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a
Joint Labour ﬁcB:.:mmE:n—. hoa a period of not less than two yeats, or”.
[Vide :J:.vs:m Act 39 of _wvm sec. 3 ﬁimm '12-8- E.\m: )
Kerala.—In section v>. in sub-section (3), for clause (a), substitute :ﬁ mozoitam clause,
namely:— L
“(a) he is, or rnm been, a _cnrns_ 058_. =o~ Eoi zam n_:.w E« a U_m:‘:..n ?n_mﬁ Qr. is
qualified for. mvvoggﬁsn as a Judge of a High:Court; or”. - .
.[Vide Kerala: Act 28 of 1961, sec."2- (wef ww.vm_oa:_ e . )
Madhya _.:Emmr —In mmnnos 7A, for m:_u.manao: Auv\ mcmeEm the EE.SSW sub-section,
namely:— ' R
“(3) A person shall not be m:»rmmm mon ﬁumn_:gﬁ-n as the 1~mm_a__bm 0503 of a
Tribunal unless— .
(a) he is, or has been, a ucamm of a m_mr Oo:.z. or’
“ 7 (b) he'is-eligible for being appointed a:Judge of a High Court;’ or
() ‘he has worked as President of the Board of Reverue; or
(d) he has worked as a nﬁ:.&mn of :5 momnn of Revenue for a _um:oa om not.less
: than three years; or N
"(e) he has worked as ﬁo:ﬁ:wﬁo:mn of _LVOE, fora 19.5& of not less .._S: three
years; or




PN

24 The Industrial Disputes Act," 1947 [Sec. 7A

(f he has worked as a member of the Industrial Court constituted under
section 9 of the Madhya Pradesh Industsial Relations Act, 1960 (27 of 1960),
for a period of not less than five years.” . . Lo

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 19 of 1988, sec. 3 (w.ef. 15-1-1989).]

Maharashtra.—In section 7A, in sub-gection (3), in clause (a), am.ﬂ_. the words .:_Eumn of a
High Court”, insert the words “or a District Judge or a person qualified for appointment as a
Judge of a High Court”. . L : o .

[Vide Maharashtra Act 2 of 1963, sec. 2 (wef 4-1-1963).) * . - o

In section’ 7A. in sub-section (3), in clause (aa), for the words ,zvu >nn.so=ww District
Judge”, substitute the words “an Additional District Judge or an’ Assistant Judge or”. .

After clause (b), [Ed. Clause (b) has been omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21:8:1984)), insert the following clause, namely:— ; - .

“(c) he has for not less than five years been a presiding officer of a Labour Court,
constituted under any law for the time being in force.” - :

[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 3] '

Aftor clause (c) insert the following clause, D.m:..m_v..lu ) )

“(d) he holds degree in law of a University established by _mi in E...v\ part of India
and is holding or has held an office nol lower in rank’ than. that of
Assistant Commussioner of Labour under the Stat: Government for not less than ten

. years” . )

[Vide Maharashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 3) 4

Mysore (Karnataka).—(1) In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clausz (a), insert the
following clause, namely — , o

“(aa) he 1s, or has been, a District Judge, or”

(Vude Mysore Act 6 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 31 1.1963).] o §

(2) In clause (aa) as inserted by Mysore Act 6 of 1963, alter the words ,U_mn:n” Judge”,
insert the words “for a period of not less than three years.”

" [Vide Mysore Act 25 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.ef 12-12-1963).] o

Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made J. Central Act
46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984). ’ : :

Orissa—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause ?vw insert the following clause,
namely:— " * R e . A

#(an) he has been a member of the Orissa Superior Judicial Service for a period of nol
less than seven years.” : . ; .

[Vide Orissa Act 6 of 1960, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 17-3-1960).] R S

West Bengal.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “High
Court”, insert the words “or a District Judge or an Additiona! District Judge”.

-[Vide West Bengal Act 17 of 1958, sec. 3 (w.ef. 22:9-1958)] - )

In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitued the following &ucm@ namely:—

. “(aa) he is, or has been, a District Judge or an Additional mec‘mn,::amﬁ AEz...‘

[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 4] .

" ‘COMMENTS : ~ -7
Power to constitute Industrial Court/Tribunal ) . o .

Section 7A empowers the appropriate Government to’ constitute one or more
{ndustrial Tribunals for adjudication of the disputes relating to any matter specified in the
Schedules. The Second Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the jurisdiction
of the Labour Court. The Third Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the
jurisdiction of the Industrial Tribupal; Jagdish Narain Sharma v. Rajasthan, Patrika Ltd., 1994
LLR 265 (Raj).

J T

g ey —

R

Sec. 7C) The Industrial, Disputas Act, 1947 : 25
i
... .1{7B. National Tribunals.~—(1) The Central Government may, by notification
. in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more National Ind sstrial Tribunals for
the adjudication of industrial disputes which, in the opition of the Central
Government, involve questions of national importance or ire of such a nature
that industrial establishments situated in moye than one S:ate aré likely to be
interested in, or affected by, such disputes. R

_
" (2) A National Tribunal shall consist of one person only to be appointed by
the.Central Government. . ) N o
© 7(3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as he Eo&&bm officer
of a National Tribunal ?[unless he is, or has heen, a Judge >f a High Court].
(4) The Central Government may, if it so thinks fit, apoint two persons as
assessors to advise the National Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]

"Y7C. Disqualifications for the presiding officers of 'Labour Cousts,
Tribunals and National Tribunals.—No person shall bz appointed to, or
continue i, the office of the presiding officer of a Labou: Court, Tribunal or
National Tribunal, if— o Ce ;

" (a) . he is not an independent person; or B
(b) he has attained the age of sixty-five years.]

STATE AMENDMENTS
Assam.~- In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following provis:, namely:—

“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribun: | appointed by the State
Government attains the age of sixty-five years before ‘he completion of any
Lo proceedings pending before him, the State Government may, if in the opinion of
' such Government public interest so requires, order his co: tinuance in o%?um for a
- period not exceeding six months for completion of the preceedings.” )

_ [Vide Assam Act 3 of 1962, sec. 3 (wef. 30-4-1962)] J . , :
" Punjab, _wwnxn:u\..,ﬂr..a-.—nmmww_—.ﬂ'g section 7C, for clause (b), .._g,:vmne.m.&m following
claisse, namely:- Ll e g S : ST

. by .he hag attained the age qf sixty-seven years". B SRR

. [|Vide Punjab Act '8 0f.1957, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); and the.Cential Act 31 of 1966 * -

West Bengal.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the moH_oiFWMWoim@ namely:—"""

i “Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribung appointed by the State
Government attains the age of sixty-five years before compl4tion of any proceedings
pending before him, the State Government may, if iy ‘the opinipn of such
Govemument public interest so requires, order his continuarfce in office for a period

... . not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.” )
. T.\ingnwnmnbmm_»,n_,:oﬁumuw\mnn:,wﬁi.n.m.wﬂ.‘uolwumv._

: t0 ¢ i i o SECTION 7D |
Gujarat.—After section 7C, insert the following section, namely:d-
“7D. Certain District Judges gqualified for appointments jon Tribynal constituted
by State Government.—Notwithstanding anything contain in sub-section (1) of
section 7A,~— o T, ) b '
" (1) The State Government'may constitute an Industrial Tribunal under that sub-
section for performing such other. functions as may be su.m_.mw._nn to it under this Act.
(2) Where the State Government constitutes a .?:u::m_ under section 7A, the
Tribunal may consist of a person who is, or has been, for z period of not less than

1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).
2. Subs. by Act46 of 1982, sec. 5, for certain words (w.e.f. 21-8-1984}

|
i
t
i

o 1




c e

-

_ ) * 3 4 j Y2 " )
26 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 {Sec. 7C L
-5 years, a District Judge ‘or .an .Additional. or, Joint District Judge. and
- notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (3) of section 7A but subject to

section 7C, such person shall be deemed |
presiding officer of the Tribpnal. .~ -

"(3) The appointment of a person q

" consultation with the High Court."”

- [Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1962, sec. 2 (we.f. 9-8-1962).]"

be qualified for appointment as the

ed qnder clause (2) shall be made after

" g Filling of -vacancies.—If, - for -any-reason. a- vacancy (other -than a
temporary absence) occurs in the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court,
Tribunal or’ National Tribunal or-in ‘the:office of the. Chajrman.or. any ather

member of a Board or Court, then, in:the case of a National. Tribunal, the Central

Government and in any other case, the appropriate Government,.shall appoint .

another pérson in accordance with the provisions of this Act'lo fill the vacancy,
and the proceeding may be continued before the Labour Court, Tribunal,
National Tribunal, Board or Court, as the case may be, from the stage at which
the vacancy is flled] o T

2[9, Finality of orders constituting Boards, etc—(1) No ‘order ‘of the
appropriate Government or of the Central Government appointing’any person as
the Chairman or any other member of“a 'Board or Court or as the presiding
officer of a.Labour Court, Tribunal-or National Tribunal shall be:called in

" question in any. manrner; and no act or proceeding before any Board or Court

shall be called in question in any manner on'the ground merely of the existence
of any vacangy i, or defect.in the constitution- of, such. Board or Court.

-+ (2) No settlement arrived at in the course of a conciliation proceeding shall
be invalid by reasononly of the fact that such’settlement was arrived at after the
expiry of the period referred to in'sub-section (6) of section 12-or sub-section (5)
of section 13, as the case may be. -~ " R

_ {3) Where the report of any settlement arrived at in the course’ of .nm_us.nm:%:o:
proceedinig before a Board is sigried by the"Chairman’'and all the other'members
of the Board, no such settlement shall be invalid by reason only of the casual or

unforeseen absence of any of the members (including the Chairman) of the'Board

during any stage Of the proceeding'] .

At o CHAPTERJIA 2

o . NOTICE OF CHANGE . _ "

- +9A. Notice of change.—No, employer, who proposes. to effect.any. change in
the conditions of service -applicable:to any workman. in respect of any matter
mﬁn&&m&. in the Fourth Schedule; shall effect such change;/~r e

(a) without giving to the workmen likely to be affected by such change

a notice in .the prescribed manner .of the. nature.of the. change
_...mnomo..mwu;o be-effected;or .. - .. iwo e o]

“(b) "' within twenty-one days ‘of giving"such riotice” " s

. Provided that.no notice shall be requi “effecting any such change—

1, Subs By Act 36 of 1956, sec.'5, for section 8 (w.
" by'Act 40 of 1951, sec. 4 (w.e.f 26-6-1951).¢- ./« S .
2. Sibs. v<”>2 36°0f 1956, sec. 5, for section 9 (wie.f. 10-3-1957).- Earlier section 9 was amended

by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 26-5-1951).. . T

3. Chapter IIA (containing sections 9A and 9B) jns, by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 6 (w.e.f, 10-3-1957).

u.o.qu.,cmé., Earlier section 8 was substituted

T TR ey




3

,@mnu(vu’é —-I

W= o Sto T0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

3

ite of India

Gaze

EXTRAORDINARY
WA []—@UE 3 IY-WUL (j)
PART II—Section 3 Sub-section (i)
iR ¥ yenriyra
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

|, 275) 73 TSeelt, gewtaar, aler 30, 201539 10, 1937

No. 275} - NEW DELHI, THRUSDAY, APRIL 30, 2015/VAISAKHA 10, 1937

T AT AT HATH T
arfergEET
T3 Restt, 6389, 2015

AT, 336() it e, e R R, 1947 B e 38 A AT (1) &
TS () FIRT R ARG A AT FQ §¢ Referie Fram st 8, srafq —

1. dftre awr s s —(1) 57 FaEt w1 dftm T s =y, st gl sk oy sfter
(3, 9 & 37 {7 F FRawer o) o) Fe, 2015 8

(2) T T F ITF THEW.F T % T99 g |
2. qRATSTG—(1) 57 Fewt § St qe b et & srerar sfe 7 8y —
@) arférﬁw%sﬁaﬂﬁa:ﬁam s, 1947 (1947 7 14) wfida & ;

(@) “drerei s & srfafea f g7 7, #ITRT 7% A1 1T 7@ & 37efie fareta s % €9
¥ fgw srfe s & |

(2) 3 erecl SR =T ¥, S 37 Fwwt § wgeh € oy ofenfa a8 § oiq sy § o &
7% gt orf § off I arfafAeas 3 wwen e ¥

3. Friwe e Jara et f Nl sfesrd s F gl £ 27 § RfgRe € ol
ATt 1 o R gt i Fanfrgw maraefer i 2o & fgf Sas o v arg o ¥ o i |

1926 GI/2015 ' )




3 T

1 @W\J’\Qﬁ( wre ’II

2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

4. AT—(1) Tl ¥ o ST 1 A 80,000 7 (Frerw) w1 Frw 3 & 2
ﬁ?ﬁﬁﬁmﬁmmﬁsﬁﬁ@nﬁwﬁﬁgﬁﬁwﬁr@mﬁwmﬁsﬁ#a&nﬁw&m
qg

(2) 571 =TT A AR AR 3 RaTee R F e Frer

(i) forerm waraefter (773 @) - 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070 =.

(ii) fSretT =amamefer (w2 Sof) - 57,700-1230-58,930-1 380-67,210 .

(iif) et =arrefter (srfaser 39) - 70,290-1540-76,450 =.

9id A1E % aa & usher Yo, O YT AT o JarfAgi FEmR N E AR A

aiq 7 % dierdi s & w7 # 0 =fr f fgfs e i ST =TRF FaT AT I g 7
W(W)mmm%mm%wﬁméﬁrﬁmﬁﬁmﬁﬁ%m%ﬁﬁﬁ

IR AT AT & AT SO T § AT 0 R g & 8, Do st b R 2

e daw & e Yo % swex it @ w s Ry s |

5. TS TP SR A roreit AT s s 9 7 & S 6 A et v
qaTCd AT T 2T 4
(2) s =aTaTer AT sheRf st ¥ forei sl F 9 wwqEr TS S AW ¥
w@ﬁﬁ#ﬁzw%mﬁ’aﬁwﬁﬁmm—wva@&ammwgﬁ
t‘ gﬂrﬁa‘mﬂﬁm%ﬁma@ﬂﬁwaﬁuﬁﬁwﬁ?ﬁ%wmﬁqaﬁ%ﬁ%amﬁ?
g | o | |
6. Wﬁmﬁ.ﬁﬂr@qm%ﬂaﬁaw@wﬁﬁﬁaﬁmmwéﬁ@mﬁm '
| RIEIERIE XS ICILIE Ao &8
i (Z)Wmmﬁdﬁﬁaﬁmﬂm%ﬁaﬁwa@mﬁﬁ%wmﬂ%%ﬁm%
Hﬁ‘ﬂ%’mﬁﬁﬁammﬁaﬁ%aﬁ?ﬁﬁaﬁﬁ@%n
7. ﬁmﬂam.—nﬁwm%ﬁaﬁaaﬁw&ﬁ%ﬁq#ﬁvwmwtﬁwﬁ@m
mﬁwﬁﬁ%mwma@?ﬁaﬁ?a@#ﬁwwwmmﬁﬁﬁiWW%WW
(f%ﬁﬁawﬁaﬁ)ﬁw,mMﬁwméf%gﬁméﬁ%ﬁqmﬁl '

(2)WWWWW%WW%W,%W@WWW
%W'W@Wﬁ?ﬂﬁﬁlﬁ?ﬁ%ﬂﬁﬁ?%ﬁﬁ'ﬁ?ﬁl
8. @._mm%maw*m,g@amam@wam
~ATAERST FT ToT T & |
(Z)WWWWW%WW%W,@ﬁWWW
W%ﬂ&g?’mﬁﬁﬁwmﬁvﬁ%mﬁwﬁﬁwﬁﬁgﬁr
9. Wﬁkmm.ﬁﬂﬁéﬁﬁ%w%ﬁsﬁh@%&ﬁ%%qﬁwmwmmﬁﬁm
mwmﬁaﬁga%ﬁwmﬁwaﬁarﬁwﬁmmmmwmﬁmml

____ 12)%Wﬁmm%mmmﬁmw.m%mw
‘ W%mea@uw%wwwﬁa%mml




—M
‘Qmexbwé -JJ:

[ 9/ I-E7€ 33) ] YA <hT TSUS @ THYR 3

10. ITAT AT —~TSTEIT SFTAFTAT FT IAF [AFFISIT 5 THT I AT 7 I AT gehg Tl & ST AT
AT % HATC BT |

1. gl avar Rama.—(1) TP sfdrecr & ferdia aftrRat & forg d=tg g & agaq it & fog
AT FARY € A g F forg gt A= Farara geft o

(2) =¥ =rETEy SR ARtE afwcr F Do afdwiat & forg gt amr Ramaa derda sftmhat
H g & e ) FRE F s itain sfe w gar ang Rae & g GRata g
12. quﬂr@waﬁﬁw%mw@mﬁﬁ%ﬁqﬁqwmwmwﬁﬁ%
$t 5 Frrq FH F 77 F qTEA W F1 gy Bt e

(2) =/ =grEATEd AT SARAAE At F e gfteniat #r ag Fwer ot &% a1 3 awrdi
HTAT & TAST & 7Y T T6 FIR @ AT 9 FTgA F1 TAW7 FfAATE T g 1g g=ger e e
R & |
13. TG AT HAT—(1) Svaaq Avft F Gl Faat & o seerg rEiEer a<r g sienfis
HTEFRT AT HF AT F FEYGY FA F (A [N § FeAaF g 3T THILAT & TH g 0
HEITAY F TG AT T T TATATA0 JTHAT AT ZHT |
(2) = =T 47 senfie srfdser & ferf sfdwiat & forw wrmiaor g s
. AT F e 9% R F s iEate |t F o T g F garan faat &
AT T | |
14. gt afdsg-fRY g —dhordw afdsiat f1 saferh 9fis-RE @ § [ F g
Wﬁﬁaﬁ%wwaﬁrﬁ@ml
15. wﬁwﬁ—wmﬁﬁmﬁﬁaﬁwﬁ%%m&r@mm%mﬂamw
Wﬁﬁm%ﬁaﬁaﬁ?mﬁ%w@amﬁ%ﬁww%ﬁﬁm$mww grenfis
srfyaer a1 Tt s g e fvg smad, i 0 g o 39w Rt aregsrd g )

16. ﬂrﬁv*ﬁa‘%w&——ﬁwmﬁﬁﬁaﬁ%%ﬁqﬁaﬁ%@aﬁmm%mﬁﬁﬁﬁm
frfarer v o arfze gt

[€. S1e-25025/05/2013-8TTaqd-2]
¢St AT, dad ai=e
MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 6th April, 2015

G.S.R. 336(E).—In excercise of the powers conferred by clause (c) of sub-section(1) of Section 38 of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Presiding Officers of the Labour
Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service)
Rules, 2015.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Definitions.—(1) In these rules, unless the context otherwise requires,-

(a) “‘Act” means the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 1947);




4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

" allowance shall be as admissible to the serving judges'of'High Courts.

(b) “Presiding Officer” means a person appointed as presiding officer under Sections 7, 7A or Section 7B
of the Act.

(2) All other words and expressions used and rot defined in these rules but defined in the Act shall have
meanings respectively assigned to them in the Act.

3. Duration.—In case of appointment on deputation of serving judges as presiding officer, the normal period

of appointment shall be for a period of three years and in case of retired judges, the appointment shall be till the age of

65 years.

4.  Salary.—(1) The Pay of the Presiding Officer of National Tribunal shall be fixed @ Rs 80,000/- (fixed)
per month and this shall include the deputation allowance in case of serving judges and gross pension in case of retired
judges.

(2) The Salary of the Presidihg Officer of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be-
(i) the District Judge (Entry Level) - Rs. 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070
(ii) the District Judge (Selection Grade) — Rs. 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210
_(iii) the District Judge (Super time Scale) - Rs. 70, 290 -1540- 76 450

per month inclusive of gross pension, pension equivalent or other retirement benefits, if any:

Provided that in the case of an appointment of a person as a presiding officer, who has retired from Judicial
Service or as Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or Joint Commissioner of the State Government and who
is in receipt of or has received or has become entitled to receive any retirement benefit by way of pension, the pay of

presiding officer shall be reduced by the gross amount of Pension from the Pay so fixed.

5. Dearness Allowance.—(1) The presiding officers of National Tribunal shall receive the dearness allowance
at the rate as admissible to the serving judges of the High Court.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be entitled to dearness allowance as
applicable to Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government drawing an equivalent pay from time to time
subject to the condition that relief of pension is deducted from thie emolument drawn during the period of
re-employment.

6 City Compensatory Allowance.—(1) For presiding officers of National Tribunals, the cily compensatory

(2)  For presiding officers of Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the city compensatory allowance shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group —“A” Officers of the Central Government.

7. Medical Concession.—(1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the Central Government Health
Scheme facilities shall be available at the station of posting and where the Central Government Health Scheme is not in
operation, they shall be entittled to the facilities as provided in the Central Services (Medical Attendance) Rules, 1944.

(2) For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the medical facilities shall be regulated
under the rules as applicable to the Group-** A” Officers of the Central Government.

8. Leave.—(1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be as
admissible to the serving judges of the High Courts.

(2)  For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government.

9.  House Rent Allowance—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
rent free furnished accommodation or, as the case may be, the house rent allowance at the rate of thirty per cent of the
basic pay.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, there shall be provided the House
Rent Allowance as admissible to the Group-“A” Officers of the Central Government.

10. Travelling Allowances.—The presiding officers shall be entitled the travelling a]lowance as per their

entitlement on the rates at the time of their re-employment.




An nefure I

(9 I-Ev 3(1)] | HRA &1 ToITF 2 STHIYR] . 5

i

11. Leave Travel Concession.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the leave travel
concession for self and family shall be as admissible to the highest grade in the Central Government.

(2)  For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the Leave Travel Concession

shall be regulated under the rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of Presiding Officers
appointed on re-employed basis.

12, Conveyance Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
the conveyance allowance in the form of a fixed amount to be decided by the Central Government from time to time.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal may have an option either to have a

staff car for official purposes or use of own vehicle with a grant of seventy five litres of petrol per
month.

13. Transfer Travelling Allowance.—(1) The transfer travelling allowance shall be as admissible to a
Government Servant of the highest grade from home town to headquarters for joining the National Industrial Tribunal or
Labour Court and from headquarters to home town at the end of the assignment.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the transfer travelling allowance

shall be as per Central Government rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of presiding
officers appointed on re-employed basis.

14.  Contributory Provident Fund Scheme.—The presiding officers shall be entitled to join Contributory
Provident Fund Scheme as per rules during the period of re-employment.

--—+~18, ~~Other Conditions of Service.~Matters relating to the terms and conditions of service of the Chairperson -
or other Members with respect to which no express provisions has been made in these rules, shall be referred by the

Labour Court, Industrial Tribunal or National Tribunal to the Central Government for its decision, and the decision of the ‘
Central Government thereon shall be binding.

16. Power to relax.—The Central Government have power to relax the provision of any of these rules in
respect of any class or categories of persons. : ‘

[No. Z-25025/05/2013-CLS-II]
DHEERAJ KUMAR, Jt. Secy.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-! 10064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.




Check-list ffon' each judicial officer to be considered for the post
of Presiding Officer, CGIT-cum-Labour Court, Chandigarh-II

Name of the Officer:

Annexure-IIX

Sl. | Document Status of enclosure
No. of document
Y -Yes
N - No
, NA — Not Applicable
1 Copies of Annual Confidential Reports of the officer
during the last five years
2 Vigilance clearance of the officer
13 Integrity certificate of the officer
4 Annexure-IV
(Proforma for Bio-Data of the Officer)
5 Annexure-v
' (Proforma for ACR Gradings for the last five years of the
Officer)

(Sign and Seal of the

Registrar General

of the concerned High Court)




Annexure-1IV

Proforma for Bio-data
(to be filled by the judicial officer concerned)

1. | Name (in full)

2. | Date of Birth

| 3. | Educational Qualification

4, | Particulars of Service in brief with dates of
each appointment held from the level of
Additional District Judge or equivalent post

(In Chronological Order)

(Note: Experience with regard to Labour
.| matters may be specifically mentioned)

5. | Details Name of the last/current post
n Date of appointment to
reslpect last/current post
oflast/  "pate of retirement
current .
post Scale of pay
held Last pay drawn

6. | Address for communication

7. |-Phone no. (Office)

(Residential)
(Mobile)
8. | E-mail address
Date: , Signature:
Place: Name:




Annexure-VY

Proforma for abstract of ACR Gradings for the ACRs of the last five years of each

judicial officer to be considered for the post of Presiding Officer,
‘Central Government Industrial Tribuna

l-cum-Labour Court, Chandigarh-Il

Name of the Officer:

SI. | Year/Period | Details of Details of | Details of

No. | Reporting Reviewing | Accepting
Authority & | Authority & Authority &
Grading Grading Grading

1 .

2

4

5

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General)




	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005
	00000006
	00000007
	00000008
	00000009
	00000010
	00000011
	00000012
	00000013

